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6 March 2017  

 
 
FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000 (FOI) REQUEST  
 
Thank you for your request, received on 20 February 2017, regarding training courses provided by 
the Common Purpose Charitable Trust.  
 
Specifically you requested: 
 
1. How many staff and contractors did you and all subsidiaries spend on Common Purpose training 
courses in the past 30 years? Please include current and ex- contractors and current and ex-
employees. 
 
2. What was the total cost of this? Please give a total including VAT and one not including VAT and 
confirm if you or any subsidiaries paid VAT. 
 
3. Are you and any subsidiaries aware of any current or ex-employees and current or ex-contractors 
that took Common Purpose training, but not via yourselves in the past 30 years and if so how 
many? 
 
4. Please list all known Common Purpose graduates within your organisation/company and 
subsidiaries. 
 
Our response: 
 
1. Our records indicate no members of staff or contractors have attended Common Purpose 

training courses since the Committee on Climate Change (CCC) was established in 2008. The 
CCC does not have any subsidiary companies. 
 

2. The CCC has not incurred any expenditure on Common Purpose training courses.  
 

3. The CCC does not hold information on training courses taken by current or ex-employees and 
contractors in a personal capacity outside of their employment with the CCC. Therefore, we 
cannot supply you with this information as this information is not held by the CCC.  

 
4. There are no known Common Purpose graduates within the CCC. 
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If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to ask for an internal 
review. If you are not content with the outcome of a review, you may apply directly to the 
Information Commissioner for a decision.  
 
In keeping with our transparency policy, the information released to you will be published on 
www.theccc.org.uk. Please note that this publication will not include your personal data.  
 
Kind regards, 
 
 
 
 
Committee on Climate Change   
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