

4 July 2019

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000 (FOI) REQUEST

Thank you for your request, received on 6 June 2019.

Specifically you requested:

Please provide the following information:

1. The dates for the trip(s).
2. The number of staff attending.
3. Cost of flights.
4. Departure and destination airport.
5. Class of travel for each passenger.
6. Airline used for each passenger.
7. Cost of hotel or similar accommodation.
8. The number of nights in the hotel or similar accommodation.
9. The number of rooms booked in the hotel or similar accommodation.
10. All miscellaneous expenses. This includes, but is not limited, hotel transfers, taxis, public transport, meals, drinks and other stipends.

Our response:

The information held in our records is disclosed in the table shown in Annex A. We have interpreted your request as requiring information in relation to trips involving air travel only. The information has been extracted from our financial records.

This concludes our response to your request.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to ask for an internal review. If you are not content with the outcome of the review, you may apply directly to the Information Commissioner for a decision.

In keeping with our transparency policy, the information released to you will be published on www.theccc.org.uk. Please note that this publication will not include your personal data.

Kind regards,

Committee on Climate Change

Annex A

Period	Date	Number of staff attending	Cost of flights (£)	Departure Airport	Destination Airport	Class of travel	Airline	Accommodation cost (£)	Number of nights	Number of rooms	Miscellaneous expenses (£)
2016-17	19/06/2016	1	167.64	London	Edinburgh	Economy	British Airways	Information not held	Information not held	Information not held	22.00
2016-17	10/01/2017	1	85.00	London Gatwick	Turin	Economy	Information not held	Information not held	Information not held	Information not held	Information not held
2017-18	06/11/2017	1	800.00	Information not held	Information not held	Information not held	Cathay Pacific	Information not held	Information not held	Information not held	Information not held
2017-18	12/11/2017	1	363.19	London	Bonn	Economy	Information not held	Information not held	Information not held	Information not held	Information not held
2017-18	18/01/2018	1	929.4	Information not held	Information not held	Information not held	Information not held	Information not held	Information not held	Information not held	Information not held
2017-18	23/01/2018	1	607.15	Paris	London	Economy	Air France	Information not held	Information not held	Information not held	Information not held
2017-18	25/01/2018	1	749.15	London	Beijing	Economy	Air China	992.23	Information not held	Information not held	Information not held
2017-18	25/01/2018	1	749.15	London	Beijing	Economy	Air China	992.74	Information not held	Information not held	Information not held
2017-18	13/03/2018	1	5081.01	London	Beijing	Club/First	British Airways	992.74	Information not held	Information not held	Information not held